
2024-2025 CATHOLIC SCHOOL IMPROVEMENT 
LEARNING CYCLE GOALS

BELIEVE

EXCEL RESPECT THRIVE TRUST

Increase student engagement 
(i.e., academic, social, and 
intellectual) and well-being for 
all learner groups, including 
students with diverse and 
special education learning 
needs.
 
Enhance student application of 
Catholic digital citizenship, with 
particular emphasis on 
collaboration.
 
Enhance students’ overall 
health and well-being.
 
Increase awareness and 
impacts of, and accessibility to 
culturally sensitive mental 
health and well-being supports 
for all members of the DPCDSB 
community. 
 
Enhance safety and security 
measures to support the well-
being of all (e.g., physical 
environment and technology 
infrastructure; data integrity 
and privacy information 
management).
 
Increase staff well-being and 
belonging (e.g., work-life 
balance, organizational culture, 
workload management).
 
Identify and eliminate systemic 
barriers and instructional 
practices that negatively impact 
the success and well-being of 
students and staff that lead to 
inequitable outcomes.

Increase confidence in 
stewardship of resources (e.g., 
human, financial, physical and 
technology).
 
Promote practices that value 
the sacredness of creation 
(e.g., intentionally reduce 
energy, use of disposable 
water bottles, paper 
consumption, and waste 
production).
 
Enhance engagement of 
schools with a wide variety of 
community partners and 
parishes.
 
Increase operational service 
quality (e.g., community and 
staff perceptions of service 
levels; alignment of DPCDSB 
practices with all Ministry of 
Education requirements). 
 
Elevate organizational 
effectiveness (e.g., innovation 
of corporate practices, 
technology and infrastructure, 
in support of improved 
outcomes for all).

Legend:

Student Goals

Staff/ Community 
Goals

September 3, 2024

https://www3.dpcdsb.or
g/about-us/publications

Increase staff awareness and 
capacity required to address 
the impacts of colonialism, 
white supremacy, anti‐Black 
racism, Islamophobia, anti‐
Semitism, homophobia, 
transphobia, sexism, able‐ism, 
and other oppressions, in all 
areas of school culture through 
centering Black, Indigenous 
and marginalized perspectives 
and voices.
 
Increase sense of belonging 
among students and staff 
impacted by oppression and 
injustice, by uplifting the voices 
of those whose identities are 
impacted by systemic forms of 
oppression.
  
Enrich students’ sense of 
connection to their Catholic 
community and sense of 
belonging.
 

Increase the proportion of 
students from all learner groups 
meeting or exceeding the 
provincial standard in literacy 
and mathematics (e.g., by 
applying Ministry priority 
actions:  ensuring fidelity of 
curriculum implementation and 
use of instructional and 
assessment practices with a 
proven track record of 
enhancing student achievement; 
ongoing  learning to strengthen 
mathematics content knowledge 
for teaching; and knowing the 
learner and ensuring learning 
tasks, interventions, and 
supports are relevant and 
responsive).
 
Increase student critical thinking, 
communication, collaboration, 
creativity, and innovation among 
all learner groups (e.g., by 
uplifting Global Competencies 
and through deep connections 
to the Ontario Catholic School 
Graduate Expectations).
 
Identify and eliminate 
disproportionalities and 
disparities, including in 
achievement, programming, and 
discipline, by dismantling 
stereotypes towards individuals 
with diverse learning needs and 
the impacts of colonialism, white 
supremacy, anti‐Black racism, 
Islamophobia, anti‐Semitism, 
homophobia, transphobia, 
sexism, able‐ism, and other 
oppressions.

Increase, among all learner 
groups, student application of 
scripture, sacramental life, and 
Catholic social teachings to 
daily life, by increasing 
opportunities for student 
spiritual engagement in their 
faith formation.
 
Deepen faith formation and 
spiritual faith journey of staff.
 
Enhance positive staff 
perceptions regarding 
DPCDSB Catholic Community, 
Culture and Caring. 
 
Enhance positive parent 
perceptions of student faith 
formation in DPCDSB schools. 
 
Deepen the understanding of 
how social justice actions are 
guided by Catholic Social 
Teachings and faith 
development for all learners.

School:
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CATHOLIC SCHOOL IMPROVEMENT LEARNING CYCLE 
ACTION PLANS TO SUPPORT GOAL ATTAINMENT

BELIEVE EXCEL RESPECT THRIVE TRUST

School:



CATHOLIC SCHOOL IMPROVEMENT LEARNING CYCLE 
DATA SOURCES TO MONITOR GOAL ATTAINMENT

BELIEVE EXCEL RESPECT THRIVE TRUST

School:


	School: St. Martin Catholic Secondary School
 
	Believe Action Plan: - Provide opportunities and
  resources to enhance faith
  formation for all students and staff
  by making connections between
  the Virtues Program and Catholic
  Social Teachings at monthly staff
  meetings and recognizing
  students exemplifying the Catholic
  Social Teaching/Virtue of the
  Month. Additionally, supporting
  staff and students on their faith    
  journey by providing teaching
  masses to students through
  Religion classes and liturgical
  celebrations/rosary for staff on
  Friday mornings.
 
- Provide opportunities to
  strengthen connection to local
  parish with:  
    a) increased number of
        school-wide masses and
        reconciliation celebrated by
        parish priest, 
    b) conducting grades 9 and 12
        retreat programs at parish,   
    c) walking pilgrimage to parish
        for CEW mass, 
    d) celebrating graduation mass
        at parish.
 
- Prominently displaying visual
  representation of our faith, by
  liturgical season, with sacred
  spaces displayed at main
  entrance and in cafeteria.
 
- Continue to support initiatives of
  Mustang Missions, Student
  Council, BSA, ACE and
  Eco-Mustang Teams which
  cultivate a sense of community
  and respect, including raising
  funds for ShareLife, Terry Fox
  Marathon of Hope, Dr. Simone's
  Warehouse, Advent and Lenten
  Projects (Christmas Baskets,
  Clothing, Food Drives).
 
Assist with conflict resolution among students encouraging them to consider the teachings in the Catholic Faith when working towards resolution.
	Excel Action Plan: - Provide evidence-based
  instructional strategies and
  resources:
    - Use of digital tools to support 
      the alignment of curriculum in 
      regard to assessment to inform
      teaching (use of
      Knowledgehook).
    - Leverage system-level staff to 
      enhance teacher math 
      knowledge.
    - Increase the use of high-impact
      instructional practices and core 
      resources in math.
 
- Provide comprehensive literacy 
  instruction to support and
  increase effective communication
  and critical literacy across the
  curriculum.
 
- Provide diverse assessments in
  all classes to improve student
  achievement, increase
  engagement and confidence.
 
- Provide professional development
  and resources for teachers to
  support students.
 
- Refine the use of High Impact
  Instructional Practices and
  Descriptive Feedback across the
  curriculum
 
- Provide additional literacy
  enhancement course after school
  and Lunch and Learn
  opportunities at lunch to support
  students' participation in OSSLT
 
- Provide additional numeracy
  enhancement courses to support
  student learning in grade level
  math courses.
 
- Highlight opportunities for
  students to engage in
  post-secondary exploration as
  well as provide funding
  opportunities.
	Respect Action Plan: - Promote professional learning
  opportunities to increase staff
  awareness of decolonization,
  anti-Black racism, anti-Semitism,
  Islamaphobia, homophobia,
  transphobia, sexism, able-ism,
  and other oppressions.
 
- Continue to provide Social Justice
  updates at monthly staff meetings.
 
- Support initiatives to raise student
  voice, particularly regarding equity
  and diversity.
 
- Encourage student participation
  in equity and diversity initiatives
  and affinity groups: BSA, GSA,
  Filipino Club, Ukrainian Club,
  Hispanic X Club, etc.
 
- Support Student Senate
  representative, Black Community
  Action Committee
  representatives, Mental Health
  Champions and self-identified
  Indigenous students to attend all
  meetings and meet with them
  after to understand students' voice
  and needs.
 
- Support work and initiatives from
  Student Council Athletic Council,
  Mustang Missions, MY Wellness
  Group, EcoMustangs, BSA, GSA,
  and other student led groups.
 
- Promote and support Truth and
  Reconciliation Week activities and
  other Indigenous Students'
  initiatives, and aligning them with
  the Pastoral Plan.
 
- Promote and provide equity
  resources to enhance curriculum.
 
- Continue to audit resources in
  library and departments to assess
  level of diversity in resources.
 
- Provide resources to staff
  regarding cultural responsiveness
  and promoting a classroom
  culture
 
- Provide students with outreach
  opportunities for
  underrepresented groups as they
  become available.
 
- Consistently ensure that students
  feel respected and supported in
  meeting with staff.
 
 
	Thrive Action Plan: - Implement DPCDSB's mental
  health strategy and annual action
  plan (as per PPM169) to support
  the well-being needs of students.
 
- Promote and support MY
  Wellness committee and their
  initiatives, particularly throughout
  Bullying Awareness and
  Prevention and Mental Health
  weeks.
 
- Provide students and staff with
  resources to promote Wellness,
  Inclusion and attention to Mental
  Health.
 
- Support and promote initiatives of
  Mental Health Champions.
 
- School support team is available
  for students to discuss their school
  experience.
 
- School Team to reach out to
  students to follow up on their 
  progress, attendance and
  wellness.
 
- Staff to provide mental health
  check-ins and activities for all
  students.
 
- Provide resources to staff to
  increase awareness of Digital
  Citizenship and social media.
 
- Increased awareness of AI and
  other technology opportunities.
 
- Increased promotion of the use of
  the Safe School Online Reporting
  Tool.
 
- Share information with parents
  received from school supports and
  outside agencies regarding mental
  health and well being.
	Trust Action Plan: - Collection and sale of donated
  gently used uniforms from recent
  graduates.
 
- Retention of Platinum status of 
  EcoSchool certification and
  incorporate eco-friendly practices
  at school events.
 
- Engage parents and greater
  community through Social Media
  (X and Instagram), school website
  and School Messenger by posting
  school events, information items
  and student learning initiatives.
 
- Invite Trustees, Superintendent,
  Parish Priests, Catholic School
  Council, feeder schools and
  community partners to school
  events.
 
- Maintain use of School Cash
  Online by ensuring school items
  are available to parents.
 
- Allocate financial and learning
  resources responsibly and
  equitably. 
 
- Promote access to scholarships
  and assistance available to all
  students in our community.
 
- Engage with community partners
  to strengthen the SHSM
  programs.
	Respect Data: - CCCC School Climate Survey
  data
 
- Student Census data
 
- Review PD attended by staff in
  Professional Learning
 
-FNMI Self Identification process
 
- Attendance and participation in
  affinity group meetings and events
  (BSA, Hispanic X Group,
  Ukrainian Group, Filipino Group,
  GSA, etc.)
 
- Staff participation in Non-Verbal
  Intervention Training
 
- Feedback from students and 
  families
 
- EQAO and OSSLT Survey data
	Thrive Data: - CCCC School Climate Survey
  data
 
- Gr. 12 Ministry of Education Exit
  Survey
 
- Student Referrals to School Team
 
- Safe School Online Reporting
  Tool Reports
 
- Feedback fro students, families
  and staff
 
- Review PD attended by staff in
  Professional Learning and provide
  PD opportunities at staff meetings
  and P. A. Days
	Trust Data: - Number of families donating
  and/or purchasing gently used
  uniforms at school.
 
- Eco-School certification
 
- Followers and posts on Social
   Media platforms
 
- Attendance of stakeholders at
  school events
 
- Entries and participation rates on
  School Cash Online
 
- Catholic School Council Meeting
  participation and financial reports
	Believe Data: - Staff and student participation in
  school masses staff liturgies and
  Friday morning prayer services.
 
- Creation and maintenance of
  sacred spaces in classrooms,
  cafeteria and main entrances
  using school purchased and
  school created (crosses) sacred
  space items 
 
- Participation in clothing and food
  drives, Terry Fox Marathon of
  Hope, Truth and Reconciliation
  Week initiatives, Christmas
  Basket Campaign.
 
- Results from Gr. 12 OCSGE
  Survey
 
- Results from CCCC School
  Climate Survey
 
- Results from Eco Certification
 
- Feedback from students, Staff
  and Families.
 
 
	Excel Data: - Pareticipation and reportng from
  Math, school and board level
  PLCs
 
- Enrollment and participation in
  after school literacy and
  numeracy classes as well as
  literacy lunch and learns
 
- Data from EQAO Math
  Assessment and OSSLT
 
- Report Card data available via
  PowerSchool
 
- Math Processes, Attitudes and
  Engagement/Literacy Survey
  Data
 
- Board and panel results from the
  Math and Literacy Attitudes and
  Practices Survey
 
- Taking Stock Report
 
- Student Success indicators and
  data from MyBlueprint statistics
  and reports
 
- Collection of data at each
  reporting period regarding
  category entries, averages and
  forms of assessment
 
- Enrollment in Regional Sports
  Program and SHSM programs
 


